

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 11/09/2016

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 08:29

PS&E JOB NO : 16W604 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008995 REGION NO : 0
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL5104

BIDS OPENED ON : Dec 21 2016

AWARDED ON : Jan 6 2017

HWY : SR 000 ----- LOW BIDDER ----- 2ND BIDDER ----- 3RD BIDDER -----
 TITLE : BLG MACDONALD MILLER FACILITY PIPER MECHANICAL, INC. HYDRO-TEMP MECHANICAL, INC.
 REGION HEADQUARTERS BUILDING CHILLER REPLACEMENT - SWR 12911 NE AIRPORT WAY 9317 NE 72ND AVE 28465 SW BOBERG RD
 16W604
 PROJECT : PORTLAND OR 972301030 VANCOUVER WA 986659308 WILSONVILLE OR 970709280
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 999744 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 999820 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 999821

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	2ND BIDDER		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	3RD BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT			
BASE BID										
1	CHILLER REPLACEMENT									
		L.S.			-16.42 %			-18.27 %		-11.78 %
			533,000.00	445,500.00	-87,500.00	435,610.00	-97,390.00	470,200.00	-62,800.00	
2	HVAC SYSTEM UPGRADE									
		L.S.			-91.70 %			44.88 %		-5.00 %
			120,000.00	9,957.00	-110,043.00	173,860.00	53,860.00	114,000.00	-6,000.00	
		BASE TOTAL	<u>\$653,000.00</u>	<u>\$455,457.00</u>	<u>-30.25 %</u>	<u>\$609,470.00</u>	<u>-6.67 %</u>	<u>\$584,200.00</u>	<u>-10.54 %</u>	
ALTERNATE A1										
3	COOLING TOWER PUMP									
		L.S.			-8.72 %			6.83 %		66.38 %
			47,000.00	42,900.00	-4,100.00	50,210.00	3,210.00	78,200.00	31,200.00	
		ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL	<u>\$47,000.00</u>	<u>\$42,900.00</u>	<u>-8.72 %</u>	<u>\$50,210.00</u>	<u>6.83 %</u>	<u>\$78,200.00</u>	<u>66.38 %</u>	
		BASE TOTAL	<u>\$653,000.00</u>	<u>\$455,457.00</u>	<u>-30.25 %</u>	<u>\$609,470.00</u>	<u>-6.67 %</u>	<u>\$584,200.00</u>	<u>-10.54 %</u>	
		BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)	<u>\$700,000.00</u>	<u>\$498,357.00</u>	<u>-28.81 %</u>	<u>\$659,680.00</u>	<u>-5.76 %</u>	<u>\$662,400.00</u>	<u>-5.37 %</u>	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 11/09/2016

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 08:29

PS&E JOB NO : 16W604 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008995 REGION NO : 0
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL5104

BIDS OPENED ON : Dec 21 2016

AWARDED ON : Jan 6 2017

HWY : SR 000

----- 4TH BIDDER -----

TITLE : BLG
 REGION HEADQUARTERS BUILDING CHILLER REPLACEMENT - SWR
 16W604

SLAYDEN CONSTRUCTORS, INC.
 500 WILLAMETTE AVE - 97383-941
 PO BOX 247

PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK

STAYTON OR 973830247

CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100755 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT					
BASE BID									
1	CHILLER REPLACEMENT								
		L.S.			25.14 %				-100.00 %
			533,000.00	667,000.00	134,000.00	0.00			
2	HVAC SYSTEM UPGRADE								
		L.S.			-10.00 %				-100.00 %
			120,000.00	108,000.00	-12,000.00	0.00			
			<hr/>						
		BASE TOTAL	\$653,000.00	\$775,000.00	18.68 %				%
ALTERNATE A1									
3	COOLING TOWER PUMP								
		L.S.			87.23 %				-100.00 %
			47,000.00	88,000.00	41,000.00	0.00			
			<hr/>						
		ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL	\$47,000.00	\$88,000.00	87.23 %				
			<hr/>						
		BASE TOTAL	\$653,000.00	\$775,000.00	18.68 %	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE			NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
			<hr/>						
		BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)	\$700,000.00	\$863,000.00	23.29 %	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE			NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
			<hr/>						